
(1) 

 
 
 

 
  

 

 

Ļ¯ೇಷ ªಾಜÍ ಪĦÎ�ೆ 
 

 

DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT 

NOTIFICATION 

NO: DPAL 39 SHASANA 2023, BENGALURU, DATED: 03.02.2024 

The Karnataka Stamp (Amendment) Bill, 2023 ಇದಃౙ  2024ರ ಬ ವค ൟಂಗಳ 

03ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ ඩಲರ ಒඪ౭ ಡ අฉൟൿ౪ , ನ  ൟำವัಃಛಜ ಇದඝ౬  

2024ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ಒ :  04 ಎಂ්ർಜ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ಪತ ದ เ๕ಷ 

ฃಜ ಪൟ ಃ (ූಗ-IV) ಯย  ಪ ಕഔಸಃಂൿ ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං,- 

KARNATAKA ACT NO. 04 OF 2024 

(First Published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the   3rd day of February, 

2024) 

 

THE KARNATAKA STAMP (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023 
(Received the assent of the Governor on the  3rd day of February, 2024) 

 

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957. 

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 
1957 (Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) for the purposes herein after appearing; 

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fourth 
year of the Republic India as follows:- 

 1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 
Karnataka  Stamp (Amendment) Act, 2023. 

(2) It shall come into force at once.   

 2. Amendment of section 30.- In the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957, 
(Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) in section 
30, in clause (a), for Article No. [52] (b) and the entries relating thereto, the following 
shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “No. [52] (b) (Transfer of any interest secured by a bond, mortgage deed or 
policy of insurance),  

s̈ÁUÀ  – 4ಎ 

Part – IVA 

, 03  , 2024( , 14 , 1945) 

BENGALURU, SATURDAY, 03, FEBRUARY, 2024(MAGHA, 14, SHAKAVARSHA, 1945) 

. 58

No.     58 



2 

 No. [56] (if relating to paper bank guarantee and e-bank guarantee).-”  

  3. Amendment of the Schedule.- In the Principal Act, in the Schedule,- 

 (i) in Article 3, in column (3), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words 
“one thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 (ii) in Article 4, in column (3), for the words “twenty rupees”, the words “One 
hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 

 (iii) in Article 5,- 

(a) in clause (b), in column (3), the words “subject to a maximum 
of rupees one thousand” shall be omitted; 

(b) in clause (e), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “ten 
paise”, the words, “fifty paise” shall be substituted, and for the 
words “subject to a maximum of rupees twenty thousand but 
not less than rupees Five hundred”, the words “but not less 
than rupees Five hundred” shall be substituted; 

(c) in clause (i-d),- 

(i) in sub-clause (i),  in column (3), for the words, “Rupees  One 
hundred”, the words “Rupees Five hundred” shall be 
substituted; and  
(ii) in sub-clause (ii)  for the entries in column (3), the the 
following  shall be substituted, namely:- 

“Rupees Five hundred and in addition Rupees Five hundred for 
every Rupees ten lakhs or part thereof in excess of Rupees ten 
lakhs, subject to a maximum of Rupees Ten lakhs.”; 

(d) in  clause (i-e),- 

(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One 
hundred”, the words, “Rupees Five hundred” shall be 
substituted; and  
(ii) in sub-clause (ii)), for the entries in column (3), the  following    
shall be substituted, namely:-  
“Rupees Five hundred plus rupees hundred for every rupees 

one lakh or part thereof, in excess of rupees one lakh.” 
(e) in clause (j), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred rupees” 

the words, “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 

 (iv) in Article 6,-  

(a) in  clause (1),- 

(i)  in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the figures and  words, “0.1 

percent”, the figures and words “0.5 percent”, shall be substituted; 

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the  following    

shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “0.5 percent of the loan or debt amount”; 

(b) in clause (2),- 



 3 

(i) in sub-clause (i) in column (3), for the figures and words, “0.1 

percent”, the figures and words “0.5 percent”, shall be substituted; 

and  

(ii) in sub-clause (ii)), for the entries in column (3), the  following    

shall be substituted, namely:- 

“0.5 percent on the loan or debt amount”.  

 (v) in Article 8, in clause (b), in column (3) of, for the words “one hundred 

rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 

(vi) In Article 10, for the entries in column (3), the  following    shall be 

substituted, namely:-  

“Rupees Five thousand for every rupees ten lakhs or part thereof subject to 

a maximum of rupees One Crore.” 

 (vii) In Article 11, in clause (b),-  

(a) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words and figures 

“3/4 % of the amount or market value”, the words and 

figures “1 % of the amount or market value.”, shall be 

substituted; 
(b) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the 

following shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “1 % of the amount or market value.”; and  
(c) in sub-clause (iii), for the entries in column (3), the following 

shall be substituted, namely:- 
  “1 % of the amount or market value.” 

(viii) in Article 12,- 
           (a) in clause (a), for the entries in column (3), the                  

following shall be substituted, namely:-  
 “Two Rupee for every one hundred rupees or part thereof 
subject to   minimum of rupees one hundred.”; and  
(b) in clause (b), for the entries in column (3), the                  

following shall be substituted, namely:-  
“Two Rupee for every one hundred rupees or part thereof   
subject to minimum of rupees one hundred.” 

 

 (ix) in Article 14,- 
(a) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “One hundred 

rupees.”, the words “Five hundred rupees”, shall be 
substituted; and  

(b) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “One hundred 
rupees.”, the words, “Five hundred rupees”, shall be 
substituted. 

 (x) in Article 17, in column (3), for the words “Five hundred rupees.”, the 
words, “Two thousand rupees”, shall be substituted. 
 (xi) in Article 19, in column (3), for the words “Two hundred rupees.”, the 
words “Five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted. 



4 

 (xii) in Article 20,- 

(a) in clause (4),- 
(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “three percent”, 

the words, “five percent” shall be substituted and for the words 
“An amount equal to one per cent”, the words, “An amount equal 
to five per cent”, shall be substituted; and 

(ii) in sub-clause (ii) in column (3), for the words, “three percent”, 
the words “five percent” shall be substituted, and for the words, 
“An amount equal to one per cent”, the words, “An amount equal 
to five per cent”, shall be substituted; 

(b) in clause (6), for the entries in column (3), the following shall be 
substituted, namely:-  

    “Two rupee for every one thousand rupees or part thereof 
subject to a maximum of rupees five lakhs.”;  

(c) in clause (7), in column (3), for the words “three percent”, the 
words “five percent”, shall be substituted. 

 (xiii) in Article 21,- 
(a) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “five rupees”, the 

words, “twenty rupees” shall be substituted; and  
(b) in clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “ten rupees”, the 

words, “fifty rupees”, shall be substituted. 
 (xiv) in Article 22, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “five hundred 
rupees”, the words, “one thousand rupees”, shall be substituted. 
 (xv) in Article 25, in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”, the 
words “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 
 (xvi) in Article 31, in column (3), for the words “one rupee”, the words 
“ten rupees” shall be substituted. 
 (xvii) in Article 33, in clause (a), in column (3), for the words “One thousand 
rupees”, the words, “Five thousand rupees”, shall be substituted. 
 (xviii) in Article 34,- 

             (a) in clause (c),- 

(i) in sub-clause (i),  in column (3), for the words “ten rupees”,  the 
words “fifty rupees”, shall be substituted; 

 

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following shall be 
substituted, namely:-   

 “Fifty rupees plus five rupees for every rupees one thousand 
or part thereof in excess of rupees one thousand.”; 

            (b) in clause (d),- 
 (i) in sub-clause (i), for the entries in column (3), the following shall 

be substituted, namely:-    
“Rupees fifty for every rupees ten thousand or part thereof.”; and  

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following shall 
be substituted, namely:-   

“Rupees fifty for every rupees ten thousand or part thereof.” 
 



 5 

 (xix) in Article 39,- 
               (a) in clause (a),-  
             (i) in sub-clause (1),  in column (3), for the words “Rupees one 
thousand for each share”, the words “Rupees Five thousand for each share.”, 
shall be substituted; 
             (ii)  in sub-clause (2), in column (3), for the words “Rupees five 
hundred for each share.”, the words, “Rupees Three Thousand for each share.” 
shall be substituted; 
             (b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “Rupees two hundred 
and fifty for each share”, the words “Rupees One thousand for each share.”, 
shall be substituted; and  
             (c) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees two hundred 
and fifty for each share”, the words, “Rupees One thousand for each share.”, 
shall be substituted. 
 (xx) in Article 40.- 

(a) in clause (B), in sub-clause (a),  in column (3), for the words 
“three percent”, the words “five percent”, shall be substituted; 

(b) in clause (B), in sub-clause (b),  in column (3), for the 
words “One thousand rupees”, the words, “two thousand 
rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(c) in clause (C), in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words 
“three percent”, the words “five percent”, shall be substituted; 
and  

(d) in clause (C), in sub-clause (b), in column (3), for the words 
“One thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees”, 
shall be substituted. 

 (xxi) in Article 40-A,- 

(a) in clause (A),- 
(i) in sub-clause (a),  in column (3), for the words “One thousand 

rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees”, shall be 
substituted; 

(ii) in sub-clause (b), for the entries in column (3), the following 
shall be substituted, namely:- 

“Rupees Five thousand plus rupees one thousand for every 
rupees five lakhs or part thereof, exceeding rupees ten lakhs 
capital amount, subject to a maximum of rupees Twenty five 
lakhs.”; and  

              (b) in clause (B), in column (3), for the words, “three percent”, the 
words, “five percent”, shall be substituted. 
 (xxii) in Article 41,- 

(a) in clause (a), in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”, 
the words “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred rupees”, 
the  words “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(c) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred rupees”, 
the  words “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(d) in clause (d), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred rupees”, 
the words, “one thousand rupees”, shall be substituted; 

 



6 

(e) in clause (f), in column (3), for the words “rupees fifty”, the words 
“one  hundred  rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(f) in clause (g), in column (3), for the words, “rupees fifty”, the 
words “one hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; and  

(g) in clause (h), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred 
rupees”, the words, “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted. 

 (xxiii) in Article 44, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “one hundred      
rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted. 
 (xxiv) in Article 45, in clause (c), in column (3), for the words “ rupees one      
hundred”, the words “rupees two hundred”, shall be substituted. 

(xxv) in Article 47,- 
(a) in clause (a), in column (3), for the words "Fifty paise”, the words 

“two      rupees”,  shall be substituted; and  
(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “rupees two hundred”, 

the words, “rupees five hundred”, shall be substituted. 
(xxvi) in Article 51, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred 

rupees”, the words  “two hundred”,  shall be substituted. 
(xxvii) in Article 52,- 

(a) in clause (b), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the words “one 
hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be 
substituted; and  

(b) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”, 
the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted. 

(xxviii) in Article 54,- 
(a) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One 

Thousand.”, the words, “Rupees Two Thousand.”, shall be 
substituted; and  

(b) in clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One 
Thousand.”, the words, “Rupees Two Thousand.”, shall be 
substituted. 

          (xxix) after Article 55 the following shall be inserted, namely ; -  

          “56.  if relating to bank guarantee,-  

  (i) if relating to paper bank guarantee  Rupees three hundred  
 (ii) if relating to e-bank guarantee Rupees two hundred 

 

 
By Order and in the name of 
the Governor of Karnataka, 

(G. SRIDHAR) 
Secretary to Government 

Department of Parliamentary 
Affairs and Legislation 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 7 

ಸൽೕಯ ವ ವರಗำ ಮൡ౨  ๎ಸನ ರಚච ಸ฿ಲಯ 
ಅඌಚච 

ಒ : ವ ๎ಇ 39 ๎ಸನ 2023, ಂಗิฆ, ൽකಂಕ: 03.02.2024. 
The Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963)ರ 

ಪ ಕರಣ 5-A ಅലಯย  ฃಜ ඩಲคಂದ ಅඌಂತತัದ the Karnataka Stamp 
(Amendment) Act, 2023 (Karnataka Act No.04 of 2024) ರ ූಂತರವඝ౬  ಅඌಂತ 
ಕನ౬ ಡ ಪಠ ๅಂൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ಪತ ದ เ๕ಷ ฃಜ ಪൟ ಃ (ූಗ-IV) ಯย  
ಪ ಕഔಸಃಂൿ ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං,- 

2024ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ಒ : 04 
(2024 ರ ಬ ವค ൟಂಗಳ      03 ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ಪತ ದ เ๕ಷ ಃಯย  ෮ದฤ 

ಪ ಕಟ฿ಜං) 
 

ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2023 
(2024 ರ ಬ ವค ൟಂಗಳ  03  ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ  ඩಲคಂದ ಒඪ౭ ಡಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯมಜං) 

 

 ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1957ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ಡฤ ಒಂൿ 
ಅඌඛಯಮ. 
 

ಇย  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ಉഴಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 
1957 (1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 34) ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ഴโൿ 
ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ;   

ಇൿ ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ ದ ಎಪ౭ ൞౬ ಲౙ ඡ ವಷბದย  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ  
เඋನಡಲൽಂದ ಈ ෨ಂൽඦ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย:- 
 

1. ౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ 
(ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2023 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 

 (2) ಇൿ ಈ ಁಡว ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  
 

 2. 30ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1957 (1957ರ 
ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 34)ರ (ಇದರย  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ 
ಉว ೕಸมಜං) 30ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದย ನ (ಎ) ಘಡದ ಅඝ ೕದ . [52] () ಮൡ౨  ಅದಃౙ  
ීඌದ ನ෩ൿಗಳ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
 “. [52] () (ීಧಪತ , ಅಡನ ಪತ  ಅಥ฿ เ ඩยಯ ෩ಲಕ 
ಭದ ತัದ ෴โඃ ൞ಸ౾౨ ಯ ವಛბವൕ)  
 . [56] (ධಪฑ   ಂಋ  ಛ ฏഔ ಮൡ౨  ಇ- ಂಋ  ಛ ฏഔಡ ීඌದ౪ ย ).-“ 
 

3. ಅඝಯ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದย ನ ಅඝಯย ,-   
(i) 3ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  
(ii) 4ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
 (iii)  5ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 
 

 (ಎ) ಘಡ () ಯย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಗคಷౣ  ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗัಡ 
ಒಳಪഖౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ഖౣ ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
  



8 

 () ಘಡ (ಇ) ಯย ನ ಉಪಘಡ (ii)ನย ನ  (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಹൡ౨  න” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐವൡ౨  න”  ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  
“ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  เರ งඩಗಳ ಗคಷౣ  ಆದฉ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ಕല෫ 
ಇಲ ൿದಃౙ  ಒಳಪഖౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಆದฉ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ಕല෫ 
ಇಲ ඈ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 

 () ಘಡ (ಐ-ല) ಯย ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
ಮൡ౨  

(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗಳ ಬದมಜ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ ಅಥ฿ 
ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕคದ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ , ಗคಷ  ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ 
ಒಳಪഖౣ , ກೋ ವค෴ಜ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ.”. 

 

(ല) ಘಡ (ಐ-ಇ) ಯย ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

 

(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 

“ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ ೯ಡ ಒಂൿ ಲౘ งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕคದ 
ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ ಲౘ งඩ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ.”. 

 

(ಇ) ಘಡ (೬) ಯย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

(iv) 6ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 
 

(ಎ) ಘಡ (1) ರย ,-  
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕.0.1” ಎಂಬ ಪದ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “๕.0.5” ಎಂಬ ಪದ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  
(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 

෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಲ ಅಥ฿ ಋಣದ ෮ತ౨ ದ ๕.0.5”; 
() ಘಡ (2) ರย ,-  
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕.0.1” ಎಂಬ ಪದ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “๕.0.5” ಎಂಬ ಪದ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  
(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 

෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
 

“ಲ ಅಥ฿ ಋಣದ ෮ತ౨ ದ ๕.0.5”; 
 

(v) 8ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ () ಘಡದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 



 9 

(vi) 10ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬   ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 

“ಗคಷ  ಒಂൿ ಆೕഔ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ 
ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಐൿ เರ งඩಗำ”. 
 

(vii) 11ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ () ಘಡದย ,- 
 

(ಎ) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “෮ತ౨ ದ ಅಥ฿ ฆಕങౣ  
ಲ ದ ෬ว ๕ಕറ 3/4ฏ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳ ಬದยಡ “෮ತ౨ ದ 
ಅಥ฿ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว ๕ಕറ 1ฏ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗำ ಮൡ౨  
ಅಂ౾ಯඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 

() ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“෮ತ౨ ದ ಅಥ฿ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว ๕ಕറ 1ฏ”; ಮൡ౨  

() ಉಪಘಡ (iii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 

“෮ತ౨ ದ ಅಥ฿ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว ๕ಕറ 1ฏ”. 
 

(viii) 12ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 
(ಎ) ಘಡ (ಎ) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 

෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
 

“ಕඛಷ  ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ ඞฆ 
งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಎರഴ งඩ.”; ಮൡ౨  

 

() ಘಡ () ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 

“ಕඛಷ  ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ ඞฆ 
งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಎರഴ งඩ.” 

 

(ix)  14ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 
(ಎ) ಘಡ () ಯย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

 

() ಘಡ () ಯย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 

(x)  17ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
 

(xi)  19ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
 

(xii) 20ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 
 

 (ಎ) ಘಡ (4)ರย ,- 



10 

(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “๕ಕറ ಐದರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  “๕ಕಡ 
ಒಂದಃౙ  ಸಮකದ ෮ಬಲಞ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “๕ಕಡ ಐದಃౙ  ಸಮකದ 
෮ಬಲಞ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “๕ಕറ ಐದರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  “๕ಕಡ 
ಒಂದಃౙ  ಸಮකದ ෮ಬಲಞ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “๕ಕಡ ಐದಃౙ  ಸಮකದ 
෮ಬಲಞ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 

() (6)ඡ ಘಡದย , (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗಳ ಬದมಜ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“ಗคಷౣ  ಐൿ ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ เರ 
งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಎರഴ งඩ”; 

()  (7)ඡ ಘಡದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “๕ಕറ ಐದರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xiii)  21ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 

(ಎ) ಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐൿ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ (ii) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಹൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xiv)  22ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ () ಘಡದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐൿ ඞฆ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xv)  25ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” 

ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(xvi)  31ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ งඩ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಹൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(xvii)  33ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ (ಎ) ಘಡದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xviii) 34ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 

 (ಎ) ಘಡ ()ಯย ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಹൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 

෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ ಟ ಪ ൟೕ ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗัಡ ಅಥ฿ 

ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕคದ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಐൿ งඩಗำ” 
() ಘಡ (ല)ಯย ನ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 

෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  เರ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಐವൡ౨  

งඩಗำ”; ಮൡ౨  



 11 

(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  เರ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಐವൡ౨  
งඩಗำ”; 
(xix) 39ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 

 (ಎ) ಘಡ (ಎ)ಯย ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (1) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಒಂൿ 

เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಐൿ 
เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (2) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಐൿ 
ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ෩ฆ 
เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಎರഴ 
ඞರ ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ 
ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಎರഴ 
ඞರ ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ 
ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xx) 40ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 

 (ಎ) ಘಡ () ರย ನ ಉಪಘಡ (ಎ)ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “๕ಕറ ಐದರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 () ಘಡ () ರย ನ ಉಪಘಡ ()ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ ಉಪಘಡ (ಎ)ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “๕ಕറ ಐದರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
ಮൡ౨  

(ല) ಘಡ () ರย ನ ಉಪಘಡ ()ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
(xxi) 40-ಎ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 

 (ಎ) ಘಡ (ಎ) ರย ನ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (ಎ)ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

(ii) ಉಪಘಡ ()ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗಳ ಬದยಡ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“ಐൿ เರ งඩಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಗคಷ  ಇಪ౭ ౨ ೖൿ ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ 
ಒಳಪഖౣ   ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗಳ ීಡ฿ಳ ෮ತ౨ ವඝ౬  ෦ೕคದ ಪ ൟ ಐൿ ಲౘ 
งඩಗัಡ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ”; ಮൡ౨  

 () ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕಡ ෩ฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ  
“๕ಕಡ ಐൿ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 
 



12 

(xxii) 41ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 
(ಎ) ಘಡ (ಎ) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ;  

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ;  

(ല) ಘಡ (ല) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 (ಇ) ಘಡ (ಎෆ) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

(ಎෆ) ಘಡ (೧) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

(೧) ಘಡ (ಎೖ) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxiii)  44ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ () ಘಡದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxiv)  45ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ () ಘಡದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ 
งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxv) 47ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 

(ಎ) ಘಡ (ಎ) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐವൡ౨  න” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 
“ಎರഴ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxvi)  51ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ () ಘಡದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxvii) 52ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 

(ಎ) ಘಡ () ರย ನ ಉಪಘಡ (ii)ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 



 13 

(xxviii) 54ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 
(ಎ) ಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ (ii) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (xxix) 55ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
 

  “56.  ಂಋ  ಛ ฏഔಡ ීಧಪഔౣ ದ౪ ย ,- 
 

(i) ධಪฑ   ಂಋ  ಛ ฏഔಡ 
ීඌฆವย  

෩ฆ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

(ii) ಇ- ಂಋ  ಛ ฏഔಡ ීඌฆವย  ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 
 

The above translation of the Karnataka Stamp (Amendment) Act, 2023 

(Karnataka Act 04 of 2024) shall be authoritative text in Kannada language under 

section 5-A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 

1963).  
 

൭ವฑඊ ಡຄ ೕഡ 
ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ඩಲฆ 

 

ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ඩಲರ ಆඃ๎ඝರ 
ಮൡ౨  ಅವರ ກಸคನย , 

(೧. ๏ ೕಧฑ) 
ಸ౽ბರದ ౽ಯბದ๏ბ, 

ಸൽೕಯ ವ ವರಗำ ಮൡ౨  
๎ಸನ ರಚච ಇมಒ. 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

 

                                  
      [

ಮುದÎಕರು ²ಾಗೂ ಪÎ�ಾಶಕರು:- ಸಂಕಲ£ಾĩ�ಾĸಗಳ�, ಕ£ಾ�ಟಕ ªಾಜÍಪತÎ, ಸ�ಾ�ĸ �ೇಂದÎ ಮುದÎ�ಾಲಯ, ¦ೆಂಗಳ�ರು 

R.N.I.  No. KARBIL/2001/47147  POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19 

Licensed to post without prepayment   WPP No. 297 


		2024-02-05T15:04:18+0530
	THAMMAIAH




