#ms?és# TR T,

WRTITON TFLIXORTHTH
d’)a’ew ooy BB

N - VD B3oRTRD, BATNT, 04, PWFO, J0IV(IPP, OP BFTITF, OFPH) So. B8
Part - IVA BENGALURU, SATURDAY, 03, FEBRUARY, 2024(MAGHA, 14, SHAKAVARSHA, 1945) No. 58

DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
NO: DPAL 39 SHASANA 2023, BENGALURU, DATED: 03.02.2024

The Karnataka Stamp (Amendment) Bill, 2023 G335, 20240 3230 30NE

033¢ DVROTTORD Vo5tV 2w, N BRTIT,, A0l SFTLIMON YW,
20243 FToe&dT PRI R0Bs: 04 DOWITRN FoeeddT ToxsmI T I3CR
Do2sBYT (307-1V) ODE). RBFE3R2ICFTOT) 3T DTN, -

KARNATAKA ACT NO. 04 OF 2024

(First Published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 3 day of February,
2024)

THE KARNATAKA STAMP (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023
(Received the assent of the Governor on the 3rd day of February, 2024)

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957.
Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act,
1957 (Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) for the purposes herein after appearing;
Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fourth
yearof the Republic India as follows:-
1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
KarnatakaStamp (Amendment) Act, 2023.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 30.- In the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957,
(Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) in section
30, in clause (a), for Article No. [52] (b) and the entries relating thereto, the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“No. [52] (b) (Transfer of any interest secured by a bond, mortgage deed or
policy of insurance),

©



S

No. [

3. Amendment of the Schedule.- In the Principal Act, in the Schedule,-
(i) in Article 3, in column (3), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words

“one thous

(ii) in Article 4, in column (3), for the words “twenty rupees”, the words “One

56] (if relating to paper bank guarantee and e-bank guarantee).-”

and rupees” shall be substituted.

hundred rupees” shall be substituted.
(iii) in Article 5,-

(2)

(b)

(c)

(e)

in clause (b), in column (3), the words “subject to a maximum
of rupees one thousand” shall be omitted;

in clause (e), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “ten
paise”, the words, “fifty paise” shall be substituted, and for the
words “subject to a maximum of rupees twenty thousand but
not less than rupees Five hundred”, the words “but not less
than rupees Five hundred” shall be substituted;

in clause (i-d),-

(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “RupeesOne
hundred”, the words “Rupees Five hundred” shall be
substituted; and

(ii) in sub-clause (ii) for the entries in column (3), the the
followingshall be substituted, namely:-

“Rupees Five hundred and in addition Rupees Five hundred for
every Rupees ten lakhs or part thereof in excess of Rupees ten
lakhs, subject to amaximum of Rupees Ten lakhs.”;

in clause (i-e),-

(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One
hundred”, the words, “Rupees Five hundred” shall be
substituted; and

(ii) in sub-clause (ii)), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“Rupees Five hundred plus rupees hundred for every rupees

one lakh orpart thereof, in excess of rupees one lakh.”
in clause (j), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred rupees”
the words, “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

(iv) in Article 6,-

(2)

(b)

in clause (1),-

(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the figures and words, “0.1
percent”, the figures and words “0.5 percent”, shall be substituted,;

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following

shall be substituted, namely:-
“0.5 percent of the loan or debt amount”;

in clause (2),-



a

(i) in sub-clause (i) in column (3), for the figures and words, “0.1
percent”, the figures and words “0.5 percent”, shall be substituted;
and

(ii) in sub-clause (ii)), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“0.5 percent on the loan or debt amount”.

(v) in Article 8, in clause (b), in column (3) of, for the words “one hundred
rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

(vi) In Article 10, for the entries in column (3), the following shall be
substituted, namely:-

“Rupees Five thousand for every rupees ten lakhs or part thereof subject to
a maximum of rupees One Crore.”

(vii) In Article 11, in clause (b),-

(a) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words and figures
“3/4 % of the amount or market value”, the words and
figures “1 % of the amount or market value.”, shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

“1 % of the amount or market value.”; and
(c) in sub-clause (iii), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-
“1 % of the amount or market value.”
(viii) in Article 12,-
(@) in clause (a), for the entries in column (3), the
following shall be substituted, namely:-
“Two Rupee for every one hundred rupees or part thereof
subject tominimum of rupees one hundred.”; and
(b) in clause (b), for the entries in column (3), the
following shall be substituted, namely:-
“Two Rupee for every one hundred rupees or part thereof
subject tominimum of rupees one hundred.”

(ix) in Article 14,-

(@) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “One hundred
rupees.”, the words “Five hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted; and

(b) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “One hundred
rupees.”, the words, “Five hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted.

(x) in Article 17, in column (3), for the words “Five hundred rupees.”,the
words, “Two thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xi) in Article 19, in column (3), for the words “Two hundred rupees.”,the
words “Five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.



(xii) in Article 20,-
(a) in clause (4),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “three percent”,
the words, “five percent” shall be substituted and for the words
“An amount equal to one per cent”, the words, “An amount equal
to five per cent”, shall be substituted; and
(ii) in sub-clause (ii) in column (3), for the words, “three percent”,
the words “five percent” shall be substituted, and for the words,
“An amount equal to one per cent”, the words, “An amount equal
to five per cent”, shall be substituted,;
(b) in clause (6), for the entries in column (3), the following shall be
substituted, namely:-
“Two rupee for every one thousand rupees or part thereof
subject to a maximum of rupees five lakhs.”;

(c) in clause (7), in column (3), for the words “three percent”, the
words “five percent”, shall be substituted.
(xiii) in Article 21,-
(@) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “five rupees”, the
words, “twenty rupees” shall be substituted; and
(b) in clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “ten rupees”, the
words, “fifty rupees”, shall be substituted.
(xiv) in Article 22, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “five hundred
rupees”, the words, “one thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.
(xv) in Article 25, in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”, the
words “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.
(xvi) in Article 31, in column (3), for the words “one rupee”, the words
“ten rupees” shall be substituted.
(xvii) in Article 33, in clause (a), in column (3), for the words “One thousand
rupees”, the words, “Five thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.
(xviii) in Article 34,-
(a) in clause (c),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words “ten rupees”, the
words “fifty rupees”, shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following shall be
substituted, namely:-

“Fifty rupees plus five rupees for every rupees one thousand
or part thereof in excess of rupees one thousand.”;
(b) in clause (d),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), for the entries in column (3), the following shall
be substituted, namely:-
“Rupees fifty for every rupees ten thousand or part thereof.”; and

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following shall
be substituted, namely:-

“Rupees fifty for every rupees ten thousand or part thereof.”



(xix) in Article 39,-
(a) in clause (a),-

(i) in sub-clause (1), in column (3), for the words “Rupees one
thousand for each share”, the words “Rupees Five thousand for each share.”,
shall be substituted;

(ii)) in sub-clause (2), in column (3), for the words “Rupees five
hundred for each share.”, the words, “Rupees Three Thousand for each share.”
shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “Rupees two hundred
and fiftyfor each share”, the words “Rupees One thousand for each share.”,
shall be substituted; and

(c) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees two hundred
and fiftyfor each share”, the words, “Rupees One thousand for each share.”,
shall be substituted.

(xx) in Article 40.-

(@) in clause (B), in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words
“threepercent”, the words “five percent”, shall be substituted,;

(b) in clause (B), in sub-clause (b), in column (3), for the
words “One thousand rupees”, the words, “two thousand
rupees”, shall be substituted;

(c) in clause (C), in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words
“threepercent”, the words “five percent”, shall be substituted;
and

(d) in clause (C), in sub-clause (b), in column (3), for the words
“One thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees”,
shall be substituted.

(xxi) in Article 40-A,-

(a) in clause (A),-

(i) in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words “One thousand
rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees”, shall be
substituted;

(ii) in sub-clause (b), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“Rupees Five thousand plus rupees one thousand for every
rupees five lakhsor part thereof, exceeding rupees ten lakhs
capital amount, subject to a maximum of rupees Twenty five
lakhs.”; and

(b) in clause (B), in column (3), for the words, “three percent”, the

words, “five percent”, shall be substituted.
(xxii) in Article 41,-

(@) in clause (a), in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”,
thewords “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred rupees”,
the words “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted,;

(c) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred rupees”,
thewords “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted,;

(d) in clause (d), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred rupees”,
thewords, “one thousand rupees”, shall be substituted,;



&

(e) in clause (f), in column (3), for the words “rupees fifty”, the words
“onehundred rupees”, shall be substituted;

(f) in clause (g), in column (3), for the words, “rupees fifty”, the
words “one hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; and

(g) in clause (h), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred
rupees”, thewords, “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xxiii) in Article 44, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “one hundred
rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.
(xxiv) in Article 45, in clause (c¢), in column (3), for the words “ rupees one
hundred”, the words “rupees two hundred”, shall be substituted.
(xxv) in Article 47 ,-
(a)in clause (a), in column (3), for the words "Fifty paise”, the words
“two rupees”, shall be substituted; and
(b)in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “rupees two hundred”,
thewords, “rupees five hundred”, shall be substituted.
(xxvi) in Article 51, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred
rupees”, the words “two hundred”, shall be substituted.
(xxvii) in Article 52,-

(@) in clause (b), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the words “one
hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted; and

(b) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”,
thewords “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xxviii) in Article 54,-

(@) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One
Thousand.”, the words, “Rupees Two Thousand.”, shall be
substituted; and

(b) in clause (ii)), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One
Thousand.”, the words, “Rupees Two Thousand.”, shall be
substituted.

(xxix) after Article 55 the following shall be inserted, namely ; -

“56. if relating to bank guarantee,-

(i) if relating to paper bank guarantee | Rupees three hundred
(i) if relating to e-bank guarantee Rupees two hundred

By Order and in the name of
the Governor of Karnataka,
(G. SRIDHAR)
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary
Affairs and Legislation



b

TOIDCOD W 3T ONYH eHI3), FIS BWS F2W3WOOD
PRIV
N0 a;s: FOT;T0Y 39 ToIS 2023, Won¥et), BJe0T: 03.02.2024.

The Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963)3
RTTL 5-A BONE). TozsmoOD0T e9DT,YINPPAIE the Karnataka Stamp
(Amendment) Act, 2023 (Karnataka Act No.04 of 2024) O 200a80030a33), &9DT3
T, BVO5R0T)  ToEET  Tozs@WIT IR Dosm YT (on-1IV) o).
RTEIRICTOTI) e3TICDRIONTS, -

20240 300 8% 9DODD J0sls: 04
(2024 T P2e3D 30N¥ 03 3¢ DVVOFTEOL) TOEEIT TozsBIIT dBR R0LIFTONE) SoTIEN
FTE3e0NT)

FoorédT 70,0 (STWHRR) 9B 0D, 2023
(2024 T 532930 30N¥ 03 X DVOTLIOT) TaZs WOODOT 2w, NNON, BLONEINI)

TOOEET A0 IR, 19573, D3R, 3TIFBE 0B 2u0T
(STAINIOWNY

Q). Y3,E0T FOWBIWDE T LBNLTON Toor&dT A,05) 9PN,
1957 (19578 TOoFET OPRIONTD 34) Iy DD3IR), STWBB  2300T3)e) T
ONT 20N DO OTS;

QB PTI N0 ABV,T0,O,0 BREBE),  Tor&dT  Totsg
LROTENOTIODOT T8 eNIODTO I 9D O eIZeIoNe):-

1. Z0F R, BID D IB), TYT0R.- (1) BB LPARNRNRR, FIEET o, 0)
(STNR) 9DICANY, 2023 DOT FBODNIT,T),.

(2) BT BB TPBE 200N TIT,T),.

2. 30:3¢ ®VyFOPTW W JBB.- TOFET A0 LRIOND, 1957 (19573
Foor&T ORAONTD 34) 3 (VWTD), [I:|N0T DR IR0 OTI)
ee3 ¢NRINGD) 303 JFTLRTWAS () DOTWT LIVIELT RO. [52] () eNI), e9ITF,
ROWORAT SeNRTINE WTIN 88 z000DTTI,, &)3RBeERRIT,T,, DOT:-

"RO. [52] ()) (WOBRI), BN BF) IR0 edaddd DDA NPT
B3RP 003 oI Z,O 3NOF 353)

RO. [56] (BCTJT®* 2Wo50T° NOsTOES eDIY, Y-2I050T° MBI FOWOPATS) ).~

3. ©3)FRB0D 3T RBR.- 30RO BRIANTTA)S e90FL3 DS,

(i) 33 93023 LT (3)C ToOTE). "80T3) SRT) CRTIONIN” D0 TWNE
WBOR 20003 FOe)T CRTIOINE” D0 BWNPR, BSOS CRRIT,T,.

(i) 43¢ ONTLBT (3)I¢ TOOI). "Y&B,3), CRTIONNE” D0W JWNY
WBOR 2,003 SRTY TRTICNTE)” D0 BWRPT, &SOSRCRRITT,,.

(i) 53¢ 9BLBTTD,,-

() DO () ODE) S (3)3 FoOOIE), "MOR,, 00T AeIT TR TICNTLT
2wFIBEL," D0 BBNP, WENRITWIT,T),,;



9)

(2)) VOB (B) ONAS OTDOR (IHSAS  (3)3€ ToOOIE), "BIY, TR
NOW BENY BN "80e33), TyR” DOW BRNY), RSARERIITEY, 03I,
"QRB,3), AT TCPRWDIONNE NOR, ST 0T) SWRTY CRTIOINYR TR
B BNTT, WwFIBED," D02 BWNY 0TWN "e3T33 60030 SRT) BRTWIONNPNR T3
YOTO03Z" D0 BBNFI, T3RBRCBRIT,TD,;
() DOTB (680-B) AN ,-
(i) VBDOR (i) BAS (3)3€ TOOTE). “2,0E) SLTY BRTIANNAF” O
BENY DTN "23) 3eT) BeTIANNF” D0 BRNPI, wSO3RCRRIITLEY,,
D3I
(i) OBDOR (i) 3D, (B)R TOOIIS S[RNRTINY WHEPN &8
EODTTI, &SRB RAITT),, DOTWT:-
80030 SRV CRTIANNY DI, )8 BIY, OF CRTIAINDNR 953509
33), OF CRTIONNP, DT 9T 9oNT,, NOR, B3I, OF BRTIOINER
2P BED,, B3N 80T SRTY BRTIANIND.".

(&) DOTI (80-9) ONE),,-

(i) VBT (i) BAS (3)3 FoOTE). “20T SRTI CRTICINE)” O
RIENY ATWOAR "0 SRTB  BRDIANNYY" Q0W IR,
&) 3O3RV RIT,TI,,; 3N,

(i) VJDOTW (i) 3. B)R FTOOIN)S TeNRTINPR TN &5
AWSIATNM ANV TO WO woa DOTIT:-

8003 SRTY CREaAINY) B3N 20T OF SRTIOINFI), DT
)3 20T OF SR &G0 &30 LIoNT, 200830 SRV BUReTAINSD.".

(4) DOT (B) ONAS (3)3 ToOTE). DT ST CRTTICNITE)" O
RIEAY DTWOAR "0 SRTBY  BRDIONNS" Q0W IR,
BSOS RER R ST,

(iv) 63€ e9ILTTE) -

() DO (1) BE), -

(i) VTDOR (i) TS (3)3C ToOTE). "3.0.1" D0 BT NI, LIOINY
WBOR "36.0.5" DO B aa:q*;, O0BINF I, T33P RAIT, T, 303,

(i) evBWDOTW (i) 3. B)R ToOOIAS SNRWINDTE TN &3
E0DTTI, &SRB RAITE),, DOTWT:-

"R 953500 DI WP I TS J€.0.5";

(2J) DOT3 (2) def)

(i) OTDOR (i) TAS (3)3 ToOTE). "36.0.1" DO JEI aNIJ), I0JINY
WROR "3.0.5" O wcﬁ aa:qb 0BNP, 3R RIT,R),,; 03I,

(i) SVBDOTW (i) 3. B)R FTOOINS TeNRTINPR TN &5
EODITTI, 3B AIT, mo NOTIT:-

"HOO 95300 INEITT RPITS 3.0.5%

V) 83 ONBLBRT () DOBBAS (3)3€ FToOOIE). "20TD ST
BRTIONNYY" D0 BBNY WBON "0 SPT) CRTIONITS" 0
TBNI, 3303 CRR ST,



¢

wi) 103¢ 9NWLBRT (B)C FTOOOIARN SDRTINPT TINS5
B0, 3B RERRITE,, DOTIT:-

"MOR, 20T TRES BRTIONNPR WFIED, TS B3, OF CRTIONRYR
e9G3e00 SITWT LIONT, 80T ARedT BN,

(vil) 11:3¢ €93023.LTT () DOTWTE) -

() JBDOTW (i) TAS (3)3 FoOOIL), "WRIT 9IF0 200T0TEI,
a3Pe),T3 aNee3 BT 3/4803" 02 VWML aNI), L90INY BN BRI
B0 RBITES, NPV RS HFIWo 1803" DN0W J/’RNY 03I,
90FONR, T30S BRIT,R,,;

() TJDOTB (i) T, B)RC FoOOTAS JeRRTINYT BN S5
0TI TI, 3B RERAITT,, DOTT:-
"RRIT T B0BITES, e3P 203 FHTWe 1303"; &I,

() OBDOR (i) TS, (3)FC FOOOTAR TeRRTINYT BN &5
0TI TI, 3RV RERAITT,, DOTT:-

"SRRI IT00 TVTE, 3P 5T3 0SS FeTTIo 1303
(viii) 12836 93023 LTIE), -

(D) VOB (D) T (3 ToOOIAS T[RRWINYTR TN S8
0TI TI, T3 ABRERAITT,, DOTWT:-

"TOR, WO I[PT) CRTOOINYR WF@BED, 3 WOTD <SP
BREDIOINE) 9530 EITWT LINT, T3 BeWIAN."; a3,

() VOB () T, B) FOOINS SENRWINPLTH TN &5
EO0DTTI, &SRR RAITT),, DOTWT:-

"FOR, WO IPT) CRTIOINYR WFBED, &S WOTD S
CRTIONNE) 953500 &ITIT LIINT, T3 B3,

(ix)  143¢ 90BLTT, -

() DO () AN (3)C TOOORTE). "2u0T3) SRT BRFTIANTIE" 0D
RIEPNY WBAR "0 ST CRTIOVNY”’ D0V BWNPI,
&) 3O3RV RIT,T,,; eI,

(22) DOT () AP (3)RE FOOOTE). “2,0T3 SRTI TRTICNTE)” 0D
RIENY  WTBAR "0 ST CRTIOVNY”’ D0  BWNPI,
SIEIOWO N IC ANV

x)  173€ 9NELTTAS (3)3€ FToOOITE), 8073 SRTY BRTICNNLD" 0D
RIEPNY DTN "OTRBY  A0)T  TRDIAWTYY” 0D  BWNPS,
SIEIOWO N TIC ANV

xi) 193¢ e90FLBTTAS (3) ToOTE), "DTWY SRTY CRTICINE)”
N0W BINY  WRBOIR "0 IRTY)  TRDIONF” D0  BENPI,
SIEIOWO N TIC ANV

(xii) 203€ IR, BB, -
(D) DO (4)3E) -



00

D0W

(i) VBDOBR (i) BS (3)3C ToOIE). "FCFTEO eNRTTRY,," 02 BWNY
WRBONR "BeTWo WTRY,," W0 BBNYTY, Ty3BRCRIIT,E), aNI), T
WOTT, ATNVOT RWRWOM” 0W BWNE BN "STEB 08T, ANl
RRWOT" 02 BWNF, 333 B AT, a03),

(i) QVBROT3 (i) BAS 3)3C TOOTE). "FFTE eNLPTT®RY," D0 TWNY
WRBOR "FTWo WTRY,," W0 BBNY Y, TySBRCRIIT,E), aNI), "HTB
2WOTT, RENVOE WRWDOTN" D0W BBNY WHBN "HITW 0T8T, ReDOW
SRWOTN" 02 BWNFP, w303t AIT,E,,;

) 6)3¢ DOBBA, (B)I TVOOINS TNRTINY  WHPN &8
E0DTTI, &SRR RAITE),, DOTWT:-

"MOR,;, &) OF TCRDIANYR WwFRED, TS WO0TWY AIT
BREDIOINE) 9530 SITT LINT, T3 BeDIAN”;

Q) ) DOBBAS ()3 FToOOIE)., "FTTWO eNRTTRY,” DO
BENY WRBOR "FTTWo 0TBTRY,," D0 BBNF S, &SRR AIT,T,,.
(xiii)  213¢ e9eR LTI -

() OB (i) BAS (3)3€ FToOOIE), 8073 TRWIONNF)" 0 BWNY
WRBOR "YB,3), CRTIONE” D0 BWNPRY, B33 CERIT,R,; *0IY,

() OB (i) TAS (3) ToOOTE), "B3I3), BRTIONNL" DO BWNRY
WBOR 80233, BRTIANTIF)” D0 BWNYS, 33 RERAIT,T),.
(xiv) 2236 ONBLBTAS (D) DOWH (3) ToOOIJD), "80T3) [T
BRTIONNYY" D0 IBNY WO “200T3) AedT TBRTWIOINE)” 02D
BBNYIN, B 33RCRAIT,R,,.
(xv)  253¢ €93 LBTAS B)C TOOOTE). “2,0T) JRTY BRTIANINED”

RIXNY WRBOR 20T SRTB  BRTIONY)”’ N0 BINYSY,

SRR RITT,.

(xvi) 313¢ e9NBLTTAS (3)3¢ ToOOTE), "200T TRTIAN" D0 BWNY

WRBOR B3I, RTIANTY)" D0 BWNFI, 3BV IIT,T),.

(xvii) 3336 ONBLBTTAS (D) DOBXT (3)F FoOOID)., "0 AeIT
SRTOONNY)" D0 RWNY WO "60T3) AT BRTICNNED" D0
BINYIN, B 3BRCRAIT,R,,.
(xviii) 343€ 93023 L BT,

() DOT (),

(i) OTROBR (i) B ()3 FoOTE). "33, BRTIOINL” 0 TWNY
BN 60833, BRTIANTIE” 0 BWNYTY, T3P RERIIT,T),;

(i) eVBOTW (i) 3D, B) TOOINS TeNRTINPR WWePN &8
EODTTI, &SRR RAITE),, DOTWT:-

808330, BRTWIONNE) TaNR &j3C 2O ARe)T BRTICNLR 9530
200T) AT BRTIANF), DT &9ITT 290NF, 80830 CRTANINL”

() DOTB (BN,

(i) eUBROB (i) 3. (3)F TVVOIAS S[NRTINPR WBeN &8
E0DTTI, &SRB RAITE),, DOTWT:-

TS ®I), AT CRTIOINSY) P W3 PaNns, 033,
BRTIANNL"; 03I,



00

(i) VJDOTW (i) 3. B)R FTOOIN)S TeNRTINPR TN &5
ORI TI, W33 RRIT, woa DOTIT:-

"8 B3, AT CRDIOVNNY) 90 BT PaNF, 8033,
BRI
(xix) 39:3¢ WL TBTHAS, -

() DOT ()N, -

(i) SVTDOT (1) AR (3)3C TOOIE). "e90T T33P OT TN 2,0TD
A0e)T BRTIOINY" 02 VBN BN "e905 T[3O3RO0TY TR 80T
A0edTC CRETIOINS” D02 BBNP, 3)803C3RIT,T),,;

(i) OTRORB (2) BAS (3)3C TOOOITE). "eI0T TS3O3POTI) TODTT B80T
SPTD dfa—ad')omfo @ou wwmf TR 9053 &3O ROT) DR eDRTI
A0e)TC CRETIOINT” D02 BRNP, 3)803C3RIT,T),,;

(2)) VOB (V) TS (3)3C ToOIE). "eI0T T3P0 T DTTID
ST 80333, dfe)woi’)omfo N0 BBNY BN "e907 T3A3ROT) DR
200T3) AT BRTVIANINE)” 02 BWNFN, &y3A3eCRRIT,R,,; eI,

() DOTW () BAS 3) TOOI). "€90T TySO3POT WO DT
ST 80333), BRTWIONNYY” 0 BWNY WWONR "907 T33P0 TR
2,0T) AT BRTWIANINF)” 02 BWNFN, &30S CRRIT,3),,.

(xx) 40:3¢ 9BLTHA S, -

() DOTI () BE)S SVTDOT ()T (3)C TOOOIE). "BFTI eNRTTRY,,"
N0 VBN TN "B B0BTRY," 02 BWNFTY, T3S RERIIT,T,;

(2J) VOB (D) BAS OBDOTW (W)3T (3)€ FToOOIE), 20T AT
SRTIANTY)" D0W RBWNY BN "OTBY FoedT BR[NNI DOW
TBNI, 3303 RERRIET,;

(R) VOB (%) TAS SVTBDOT ()T (3)R¢ ToOIE). “BCFTBD aNRTTRY,,"
N0 BTN TN "FFCe0 0TBTRY,," D0 BWNPD, TSI RCRAIT,T3),;
AN

(&) OB () TS VIBROT ()T (3) FoOOTE), “2,0TD AT
SRTIANTY)" D0W RBWNY BN "OTBY FoedT TRTIONED" DOW
TBNI, 3303 RCRRIELT,;

(xxi) 40-0d 9RFLTTE). -

() DO (d) B, -

(i) VTDOTW ()T (3) FOOOIL), “2,0T) AT BRTIONLD" DO
RIEAY DWAR "0 AT CRTIONNY)” D0  IWNRPI,
303 R 3B,

(i) OTDOB ()T (B)FE FOOIAS TDRWING  WTBOR &3
E0DTT, &SRB RAITE),, DOTWT:-

"80C3) AT BRTIANNS) 2033, NOR, BEW, 3,400 OF BRTIANNDNR
WFTED, B3I, OF CRHTIAINY 00BN 303330, DT &8 0T OF
BRTIONNPNR 9530 €9TIT INT, 2,0T3) ARe)T BRETWICNNE”; 203,

(2J) DO () BAS (3)3C ToOIE) "FETTW 20RTY” D0 BWRNY BN
"FHTE 0T 0 BWNFP, 33 BRIT,T,,;



03

(xxii) 413¢ 90T L BT, -

() NVOTB (D) BAS (3) FOTE). “2,0T) BRTY RTINS DO
RIEPNY  WTAR "0 ST CRTIOVNY’ D0 IWNPI,
303 R 3T,

(20) DOB () TARS (3)C TOOOIE). “2,0T) BT TRFTIANTIE)" O
RIEPNY ATWOAR "0 SRTB BRDIANNYY" Q0W IR,
@3B RERAITT),,;

() DOTW () B 3) FTOOOTD), “%OTI) FRTY CRTIONINRE” 0
RIEPNY ATWOAR "0 SRTB BRDIANYY" D0W IR,
@33 RERAITT),,;

(&) VOB (&) BAS (3)3 ToOOIE), T SRTY TRTIANNED” DO
REMY DTOAR "200T) AT CRTIOVNY” D0V  BBNYSY,
@33 RERAITT),,;

() VOB (DF°) TAS (3)3¢ TOOIE). “80333), BRTWIONE” DO
RIEAY  WTWAR "200T) S[RTY BRTIOVNS)” D0  JWNRPI,
303 R 3T,

(%) VOB (23) BAS (3) ToOIE). “80e33), TLRTIANNL" DO
RIEAY  WTWAR "200TY  S[RTY  BRTIOVNY)” D0 JWRPI,
BSOS LR RIE,T,; 303,

() VOB (23°) TS (3)RC TOOOITED). "ATTBY SRTY CRTIONINRE)”
NOW RBEAY  WROR  "8083) SRTBY  CRTIONY)” D00 JRINEYSI,
30303 R 3BT,

(xxiii) 4430 ONTLBTAS () DOBEW (3)I€ ToOOITEC). "200T3) SRT
BRTIONNY)Y" D0 JBNY BN "TRY SRTY BRTICINE)" 0D
TBNI, 3303 CRR ST,

(xxiv) 4536 9T LBTTBAS (2) DOBEW (3)I ToOOTE)., “20TD  SRT
BRTICNNLR" D0 VWNY WBOR "3 SHRTY CRTJIONDNR" 02
BRI, FIO3RCRIITE,.

(xxv) 47:3¢ €902 L BB, -

() VOB (D) BAS (3)3¢ TOOOITE), “80e33), WyA" 0 BWNY WHRONR
" T BRTDWIONTE” 02 BWNF, B3OSR RIT,R,,; a3,

(2)) DOB () BAS (3) ToOIE), "TTWI SRTI TR TIANINED” O
RIEPNY  DTWOAR "0 SRTB BRDIANNYY" Q0W IR,
SIEIOWO N TIC ANV
Oxvi) 5138 ONBLBTAS () DOBET (3)€ ToOOI). "200T3)  SRT
BRTIONNF)" D02 IBNY BN "3 SRTY CRTICIN" 0D
BRI, BIO3RCRIITE,.

(xxvii) 523€ 9303 LTI, -

(D) VOB () TS NVIBVORB (ii)T (3)IE ToOOTE), "2,0T) SRTI
BRTIONNYY" D02 VBNY BN "TRBY SRTY BRTICINE)” 0D
TBRS, T IO3RERRIBTLT),; 503D,

(20) DOT () BAR (3)RC FTOOOTE). “%0T3) SRTY BTN 0D
RIENY VTR "ATRY SRTY CRDIONY” D0 BWNPI,
SIEIOWO N FIC ANV



R.N.I. No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297

0Oa

(xxviii) 543€ €930 LTRSS, -

() DOT (i) TS 3)3C FoOTE). 20T AT CRTICNINE)” 02D
RIENY DTN "OTRBY  A0)T TRDIAWTYY 0D BRSPS,
RSO3 RERR ST, 303,

(2)) DO (i) BAR (3)3€ FoOTE), “2,0T) FOeIT CRTICNINE)" O
RIRPNY WTBOR "DTRBY  AedT  CRDIOVNY)Y” D0 BINYSY,
SIEIOWO N TIC ANV
(xxix) 5583¢ E9I[LELTT 33020003 B3 B0DTTWI, ALDRIT,T,, NOTT:-

“56. 239503° N;00&31t F0WoFRE B, ,-

()

2OWORATRE).

&BCTO° 23950T° Nos80&3R | ehRTHY SRTY TN

(i) 9-23950F° MOsC0ENR FOWORATITE). | DT ST BRI

The above translation of the Karnataka Stamp (Amendment) Act, 2023

(Karnataka Act 04 of 2024) shall be authoritative text in Kannada language under

section 5-A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of
1963).

PR T WOT® B £E°
TOOEEIT D%5550OT)

TR EIT D500 T 3T TOSI AT
DI, 938 BIDIS),,
(2. )eF0?)
AT BT FoORNETIE,
RORDLOD &35e3T/00NY) 03I,

IR TS Y0B.

BED Borte BEBE- FOBUTIREOND. BUOFEsd TIBES, TEFD Beod) FuTmILd. oriwlew

THAMMAIAH



		2024-02-05T15:04:18+0530
	THAMMAIAH




